

ROCKDALE COUNTY



ITB# 25-01: Fire Protective Clothing for RCFR

4/10/2025 BID OPENING 2:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION SHEET

Item #	Item Description	Bennett Fire Products Company, Inc.	GALLS, LLC	NAFECO
1	Protective Jacket/Coats	\$2,025.00	\$2,099.21	\$1,680.00
2	Coat Name Panel	\$85.00	NO BID	\$80.00
3	Protective Pants/Trousers	\$1,686.00	\$1,356.64	\$1,185.00
4	Internal Harness	\$552.00	NO BID	\$451.00
5	Belt	\$65.00	NO BID	\$63.00
6	Suspender	\$59.00	NO BID	\$58.00
7	Helmet with leather front (black)	\$598.00	NO BID	\$450.00
8	Helmet without leather front (black)	\$523.00	NO BID	\$385.00
9	Helmet with leather front (red)	\$598.00	NO BID	\$450.00
10	Helmet without leather front (red)	\$523.00	NO BID	\$385.00
11	Helmet with leather front (white)	\$598.00	NO BID	\$450.00
12	Helmet without leather front (white)	\$523.00	NO BID	\$385.00
13	Helmet with leather front (yellow)	\$598.00	NO BID	\$450.00
14	Helmet without leather front (yellow)	\$523.00	NO BID	\$385.00
15	Firefighter Shield	\$75.00	NO BID	\$65.00
16	Sergeant Shield	\$75.00	NO BID	\$65.00
17	Lieutenant Shield	\$75.00	NO BID	\$65.00
18	Captain Shield	\$75.00	NO BID	\$65.00
19	Battalion Chief Shield	\$75.00	NO BID	\$65.00
20	Fire Marshal Shield	\$75.00	NO BID	\$65.00
21	Deputy Chief Shield	\$75.00	NO BID	\$65.00
22	Chief Shield	\$75.00	NO BID	\$65.00
23	Structural Fire Fightng Pull-On Boots	\$589.00	NO BID	\$430.00
24	Structural Fire Fightng Pull-On Boots Sizing Price Difference	\$589.00	NO BID	NO CHARGE
TOTAL Unit Prices		\$10,734.00	\$3,455.85	\$7,807.00